
 Courtesy of Senate Appropriations Committee - Republicans 

 

UKRAINE SUPPLEMENTAL 

$47 billion in emergency funding to support Ukraine 
  
 The Ukraine Supplemental Appropriations Act, 2023 provides $47.332 billion in emergency funding 
to support the Ukrainian’s valiant efforts to repulse Russian aggression and bring the conflict to an end. 
 

MILITARY AND SECURITY ASSISSTANCE  
 

 Provides $19.8 billion in authorities and associated funding to arm and equip Ukraine and 
NATO Allies to counter Russian aggression, rejecting the Administration’s request to throttle 
down support for the Ukrainian war effort. 
 

 Provides in excess of $6.2 billion for the Department of Defense to sustain the surge of U.S. forces 
and operations in Europe in response to Russia’s actions.    
 

 Provides $687 million to accelerate domestic munitions production capacity at Army ammunition 
plants. 

 

 Provides $300 million to support the Ukrainian police and border guards’ efforts to protect 
civilians, rescue victims of Russia’s persistent attacks against civilian infrastructure and cities, and 
defend Ukraine’s sovereign territory. 
 

 Includes $126.3 million for the National Nuclear Security Administration for nuclear 
nonproliferation, counterterrorism and counterproliferations activities in and related to Ukraine. 
 

 Provides $105 million for the clearance of landmines and other explosive remnants of war to 
protect civilians and troops and allow for Ukrainian citizens to return to areas liberated from Russian 
control.    
 

 Provides $50 million to address cybersecurity threats emanating from Russia and other malign 
actors. 

 
HUMANITARIAN AND ECONOMIC SUPPORT 

 

 Provides $12.9 billion in economic assistance to stabilize the economy and spur economic recovery 
in Ukraine, and to address dire energy supply shortfalls. 
 

 Includes $300 million for food security to address the food supply crisis affecting vulnerable 
populations in Ukraine, mitigate the global fertilizer shortage, and build agricultural capacity and 
resilience to shocks. 
 

 Provides $4 billion to assist refugees fleeing the war in Ukraine and address related dire refugee 
needs globally. 
 

 Includes $300 million for nuclear energy technology to promote U.S. energy independence and 
reduce reliance on foreign energy sources.   



Page 2  Courtesy of Senate Appropriations Committee 

 

 
 

OVERSIGHT REQUIREMENTS  
 

 Requires reporting on accountability of U.S. defense articles provided to Ukraine, including 
measures taken to ensure weapons, particularly ones that require enhanced end-use monitoring, are 
delivered and used as intended. 

 

 Requires recurring reporting to Congress detailing U.S. security assistance provided to Ukraine, 
including a comprehensive list of the defense articles and services provided to Ukraine and the 
associated authority and funding used to provide such articles and services. 

 

 Provides $27 million to the Inspectors General of the Department of Defense, Department of State, 
and United States Agency for International Development, as well as the Government Accountability 
Office, to conduct thorough oversight of appropriated funds.     


